From: Easler, Jessica

To: DiCarlo, Donna

Cc: Cronk, Jeff

Subject: FW: City of Sparks Sewer Refund
Date: Thursday, April 13, 2017 1:24:58 PM

From: Stephanie Haddock [mailto:Shaddock@rtcwashoe.com]
Sent: Tuesday, March 07, 2017 11:26 AM

To: Cronk, Jeff <jcronk@cityofsparks.us>
Subject: City of Sparks Sewer Refund

HiJeff —

A TMWA meter error at our Centennial Plaza transit station caused RTC to also incur additional
sewer fees. A credit for RTC's excess payments has been applied (see attached) however | would like
to request City of Sparks issue RTC a reimbursement check instead. At this rate, it will take RTC
approximately 8-9 years to use up our credit.

Please let me know if you have questions.

Thanks for your assistance,

Stephanie Haddock, CGFM

Director of Finance/CFO

Regional Transportation Commission (RTC)
1105 Terminal Way, Suite 300

Reno, NV 89502

775-335-1845 (phone)

775-348-3223 (fax)


mailto:jeasler@cityofsparks.us
mailto:ddicarlo@cityofsparks.us
mailto:jcronk@cityofsparks.us
mailto:Shaddock@rtcwashoe.com
mailto:jcronk@cityofsparks.us

